
 

Business Regulation Impact Analysis 
OBC, OMC, OPC Rules 
Page 1 of 12 

CSI – Ohio 
The Common Sense Initiative 
Business Regulation Impact Analysis 
 
Ohio Board of Building Standards 
 
Rule Numbers: 4101:1-1-01, 4101:1-4-01, 4101:1-9-01, 4101:1-10-01, 4101:1-11-01, 
4101:1-30-01, 4101:1-31-01, 4101:1-35-01, 4101:2-4-01, 4101:2-5-01, 4101:2-15-01, 
and 4101:3-13-01.   
 
Introduction 
 
In compliance with Executive Order 2011-01K and Senate Bill 2 of the 129th General 
Assembly, the Ohio Board of Building Standards (Board) has conducted a Business 
Regulation Impact Analysis (Analysis) of proposed amendments to Ohio Administrative 
Code (OAC) Rules 4101:1-1-01, 4101:1-4-01, 4101:1-9-01, 4101:1-10-01, 4101:1-11-01, 
4101:1-30-01, 4101:1-31-01, 4101:1-35-01, 4101:2-4-01, 4101:2-5-01, 4101:2-15-01, 
and 4101:3-13-01.   
 
Background 
 
The Board is charged with the duty to formulate and adopt, amend, modify or repeal rules 
of the Administrative Code governing the erection, construction, repair, alteration, and 
maintenance of all buildings or classes of buildings specified in section 3781.06 of the 
Revised Code.  Further, the Board of Building Standards certifies building departments to 
enforce the Ohio Building, Mechanical, Plumbing, and Residential Codes for the types of 
buildings and subject matters specified by the Board pursuant to Revised Code Section 
3781.10.   
 
Regulatory Intent 
 
1. Please briefly describe the draft regulation in plain language. 

Please include the key provisions of the regulation as well as any proposed 
amendments. 

 
The Board proposes to amend Ohio Administrative Code (OAC) as follows:  
Ohio Building Code Rules 
4101:1-1-01 to make corrections and delete provisions related to the certification of 
building departments, personnel, boards of building appeals, and fire protection system 
designers which are being moved in their entirety to OAC Division 4101:7;  
4101:1-4-01 to correct references to ICC 117.1 and to amend provisions related to health 
care facilities in coordination with the Ohio Department of Aging and Ohio Department 
of Health to safely enhance the quality of life for elders;  
4101:1-9-01 to correct references to the Ohio Fire Code, to make corrections to 
accessibility provisions, and to add a reference to manually activated smoke exhaust 
system to coordinate with section 910.5;  

ACTION: Final DATE: 02/08/2013 4:05 PM

BIA p(97258) pa(171979) d: (397584) print date: 07/13/2025 9:56 AM



 

Business Regulation Impact Analysis 
OBC, OMC, OPC Rules 
Page 2 of 12 

4101:1-10-01 to make corrections, to amend provisions related to health care facilities in 
coordination with the Ohio Department of Aging and Ohio Department of Health to 
safely enhance the quality of life for elders, and to readopt language included in Petition 
11-01 approved by the Board related to Group F-1 and S-1 exit access travel distances;  
4101:1-11-01 to amend several sections to further coordinate Ohio’s accessibility 
provisions with federal requirements;  
4101:1-30-01 to make corrections in references to ICC A117.1, NFPA 72, and the Ohio 
Elevator Code.  
4101:1-31-01 to rescind and adopt new OAC Rule 4101:1-31-01 to delete sections 
3102.1.1 and 3101.1.2 and move to section 3103, incorporate clarifying model code 
language related to tents and membrane structures, clarify existing language related to 
gates as a required means of egress, add reference to Ohio Manufactured Homes 
Commission rules for parks, and adds a new section for refuse containers previously in 
OAC Chapter 4101:2-88 which are to be rescinded. 
4101:1-35-01 to edit Table 3501.2 to remove the references to the 2007 Ohio Plumbing 
Code and the NFPA 70-08 for 1-, 2-, 3- Family Dwellings to coordinate with the updates 
to the Residential Code of Ohio effective January 1, 2013, to add CPSC Standard 16 CFR 
1301, to delete the reference to the International Fire code, and to edit the title of NFPA 
72. 
Ohio Mechanical Code Rules 
4101:2-4-01 to amend provisions related to health care facilities in coordination with the 
Ohio Department of Aging and Ohio Department of Health to safely enhance the quality 
of life for elders  
4101:2-5-01 to amend provisions related to health care facilities in coordination with the 
Ohio Department of Aging and Ohio Department of Health to safely enhance the quality 
of life for elders 
4101:2-15-01 to add standard ASHRAE 170 for ventilation of health care facilities, 
update ASME BPVC from the 2004 to the 2010 edition to coordinate with the Boiler and 
Pressure Vessel Rule five year rule review, make corrections in reference to NFPA 70 
and 72 Standards, and to edit the reference ASME B16.9 standard to the 2007 edition, to 
edit the AWWA C110/A21.10 standard to the 2008 edition, and to edit reference to 
ASME CSD-1 to the 2009 edition. 
Ohio Plumbing Code Rules 
4101:3-13-01 to update the ASME BPVC Standard to the 2010 edition.   
 
2. Please list the Ohio statute authorizing the Agency to adopt this regulation. 
 
Revised Code § 3781.06: http://codes.ohio.gov/orc/3781.06 
Revised Code § 3781.10: http://codes.ohio.gov/orc/3781.10 
 
3. Does the regulation implement a federal requirement?   
 
Yes. 

 



 

Business Regulation Impact Analysis 
OBC, OMC, OPC Rules 
Page 3 of 12 

Is the proposed regulation being adopted or amended to enable the state to obtain 
or maintain approval to administer and enforce a federal environmental law or to 
participate in a federal environmental program? 

 
No. 

 
If yes, please briefly explain the source and substance of the federal requirement. 
 
The Department of Justice published revised final regulations implementing the 

Americans with Disabilities Act (ADA) for title II (State and local government services) 
and title III (public accommodations and commercial facilities) on September 15, 2010, 
in the Federal Register. These requirements clarify and refine issues that have arisen over 
the past 20 years and contain new and updated requirements including the 2010 
Standards for Accessible Design ("2010 Standards”).  The 2010 Standards can be found 
here: http://www.ada.gov/2010ADAstandards_index.htm 

Since 1993, the Board has attempted to create a “safe harbor” for compliance with 
federal accessibility requirements.  With the adoption of the 2010 Standards, the Board 
amended its rules to reflect the changes.  These proposed rules further this coordination 
to help streamline compliance. 

 
Additionally, proposed rule 4101:1-31-01 incorporates updated provision related 

to refuse containers currently in a miscellaneous rule proposed to be rescinded.  Revised 
Code § 3791.21 requires the Board to adopt safety standards in compliance with 
regulations adopted by the consumer product safety commission (CPSC).  However, the 
statute and the current rule reference an out-of-date CPSC standard.  The proposed rule 
makes this correction and refers to the Consumer Product Safety Act Regulations, 16 
C.F.R. 1301.  The intent of the standards is to prevent tipping of these containers. 
 
4. If the regulation includes provisions not specifically required by the federal 

government, please explain the rationale for not incorporating the federal 
counterpart. 

  
Not applicable. 
 
5. What is the public purpose for this regulation (i.e., why does the Agency feel that 

there needs to be any regulation in this area at all)? 
 

Revised Code § 3781.10 directs the Board to “formulate and adopt rules 
governing the erection, construction, repair, alteration and maintenance of all buildings 
specified in section 3781.06 of the Revised Code…”  Additionally, Revised Code 
3781.06 provides:  

Any building that may be used as a place of resort, assembly, education, 
entertainment, lodging, dwelling, trade, manufacture, repair, storage, traffic, or 
occupancy by the public, any residential building, and all other buildings or parts 
and appurtenances of those buildings erected within this state, shall be so 



 

Business Regulation Impact Analysis 
OBC, OMC, OPC Rules 
Page 4 of 12 

constructed, erected, equipped, and maintained that they shall be safe and 
sanitary for their intended use and occupancy. 

This statute defines safe and sanitary as follows: 

“Safe,” with respect to a building, means it is free from danger or hazard to the life, 
safety, health, or welfare of persons occupying or frequenting it, or of the public and 
from danger of settlement, movement, disintegration, or collapse, whether such danger 
arises from the methods or materials of its construction or from equipment installed 
therein, for the purpose of lighting, heating, the transmission or utilization of electric 
current, or from its location or otherwise. 

“Sanitary,” with respect to a building, means it is free from danger or hazard to the 
health of persons occupying or frequenting it or to that of the public, if such danger 
arises from the method or materials of its construction or from any equipment installed 
therein, for the purpose of lighting, heating, ventilating, or plumbing. 

The Ohio Building Code sets forth the construction standards for nonresidential buildings 
in the State of Ohio to ensure that they are safe and sanitary.  Additionally, Revised Code 
§ 3781.01 provides that local governments may not adopt regulations that that conflict 
with the Board’s rules to facilitate the uniform application of the standards.  These 
proposed amendments further this purpose by clarifying requirements and furthering 
coordination with other agency rules. 
 
6. How will the Agency measure the success of this regulation in terms of outputs 

and/or outcomes? 
 
Ohio Building Code Rules 
It is expected that these proposed amendments will result in further clarification of the 
substantive requirements for the administration of the building code set forth in 4101:1-1-
01 by moving the requirements for certification of building departments and code 
enforcement personnel to another division of the administrative code.  Additionally, these 
proposed amendments will result on further coordination of regulations of adult care 
facilities with the licensure requirements of the Department of Health and the 
enhancement of quality of life for elders.  The remaining changes to the rules are 
expected to increase clarification of the rules by making corrections and updating 
references to other agencies’ rules. 
 
Ohio Mechanical Code Rules 
It is expected that these proposed amendments will result in further coordination of 
regulation of adult care facilities with the licensure requirements of the department of 
health and the enhancement of quality of life for elders.  Additionally, it is expected that 
these proposed rules will provide further clarification for the manufacture of boilers used 
in Ohio by recognizing new editions of ASME standards which are already acceptable 
industry standards and practice. 
 



 

Business Regulation Impact Analysis 
OBC, OMC, OPC Rules 
Page 5 of 12 

Ohio Plumbing Code Rules 
It is expected that these proposed rules will provide further clarification for the 
manufacture of boilers used in Ohio by recognizing new a edition of ASME BPVC 
standard which are already acceptable industry standards and practice. 
 
Development of Regulation 
 
7. Please list the stakeholders included by the Agency in the development or initial 

review of the draft regulation. 
 

On June 29, 2012, the Board sent an email to all agency stakeholders informing 
them of a scheduled stakeholder meeting on July 13, 2012 to hear comments and respond 
to questions on the proposed amendments to these rules.  The email and stakeholder 
distribution list are attached as Exhibit A.  The notice summarized the proposed 
amendments and also informed stakeholders that if they could not attend the stakeholder 
meeting, they could submit questions or comments via email or regular mail.  On July 9, 
2012, the Board sent a follow-up email to stakeholders updating the proposed amendment 
list.  The follow-up email and stakeholder list are attached as Exhibit B.  On July 13, 
2012, the Board conducted a stakeholder meeting on the proposed rules between 10:00 
AM and 11:00 AM and the following individuals attended: Michael Long, Washington 
Township; David Lockhan, City of Cincinnati; Craig Rauch, Washington Township; Tim 
Curry, OCILB & Curry Electric; Dan Larkin, Larkin Electric; Kathy Kimmet, Ohio 
Department of Health; Drema Phelps, Ohio Department of Health; Gaylord Poe, IBI, SW 
IAEI; Bonnie Kantor-Burman, Ohio Department of Aging; Felicia Sherman, Ohio 
Department of Aging; Dennis Dickard, Hamilton County Building Department. 
 

If applicable, please include the date and medium by which the stakeholders were 
initially contacted. 

 
See above. 

 
8. What input was provided by the stakeholders, and how did that input affect the 

draft regulation being proposed by the Agency? 
 
Copies of the correspondence the Board received in response to June 29, 2012 and July 
13, 2012 emails are attached as Exhibit C. 
 
Mr. Brown submitted general inquiry regarding the proposed rules.  Board Staff 
responded to his inquiry.   
 
Mr. Collins inquired into the requirements for accessibility for bariatric patients.  After 
receipt of Mr. Collins correspondence, Board Staff confirmed the language included in 
the proposed rules to be consistent with actions related to this issue at the code hearings 
in Dallas.  Proposed Ohio Building Code Section 1109.2, Exception 6 includes an added 
text change to respond to Marsha Mazz’s (with the US Access Board) concern over the 
possibility that a hospital would use the bariatric units in the count of accessible rooms 



 

Business Regulation Impact Analysis 
OBC, OMC, OPC Rules 
Page 6 of 12 

thus reducing the number of general population accessible rooms.  It was at Ms. Mazz’st 
prompting that Code Change Committee in Dallas added the text: “The sleeping units 
served by bariatric toilet or bathing rooms shall not count toward the required number of 
accessible sleeping rooms.”  Ms. Mazz is nationally recognized expert on American with 
Disabilities Act intent.  Ms. Mazz’s group in Washington at the Access Board writes the 
ADA standards for accessible design and construction. 
 
Mr. Rauch submitted an inquiry regarding Ohio Building Code Sections 407.2.5(8), 
1016.3, and 1018.2(6).  After review of Mr. Rauch’s comments, Board Staff has 
determined the following: The intent of the 8th condition listed in the proposal for the new 
section 407.2.5 is a shut-off device to assure that the cooking equipment is not operated 
without staff present and was added to account for accidental resident fires in the cooking 
area.  Section 1016.3 was inadvertently deleted from the version to be published and 
made effective November 1, 2011.  In order to reinsert the provision, it had to be treated 
as a new added-in subsection.   The issue of required corridor width is not changing in 
intent.  The sections dealing with corridor width in I-2 occupancies in previous editions 
of the code only required 96” corridors when the plan for emergency response in patient 
or resident rooms did not require the movement of the patient or resident’s beds through 
the room door and into and through the corridor.  The section is being revised to clarify 
the condition that allows the regular sized corridor width.  While the provision in 1001.4 
is also a new added revision, the concept has been in place and required for decades…an 
example of the historical provision is Section 705 in the 1998 Ohio Fire Code which 
required an “Evacuation Plan” to be written and available in each I-2 occupancy.  
Although not previously indicated in the building code, the assumption that a plan was 
required and in place at each I-2 facility was assumed as part of the overall risk 
management and control method for these higher risk occupancies.  Adding this text was 
not intended to change who is responsible for enforcement or to add a new requirement 
but rather to clarify what is necessary for the comprehensive level of safety to be assured.  
Board Staff is confident these changes are not creating conflicts, and, in fact, changes like 
these are occurring to enhance the compatibility of the two codes.  Mr. Rauch also 
attended the July 13, 2012 Stakeholder Meeting and inquired about shut off timers.  The 
Department of Aging informed Mr. Rauch they that would research the intent of the 
provision and provide him with additional information.  The Department of Aging’s 
correspondence to Mr. Rauch is attached as Exhibit D. 
 
Mr. Bull submitted a general inquiry regarding the rule amendment process as well as a 
question related to Ohio Building Code Chapter 31.  Board Staff responded to Mr. Bull’s 
questions related to process and also explained the intent of the proposed changes to 
Chapter 31.  The changes proposed would not change the intent of how the code 
requirements for temporary tents and membrane structures, but to clarify how to apply 
the requirements.  The detailed code provisions are located in the Ohio Fire Code, 
Chapter 24, and will remain unchanged.  The responsibility and authority for enforcing 
these provisions continue to be placed with the Building Official who would refer to the 
Ohio Fire Code for the requirements.  When a tent or membrane structure is intended for 
temporary use (under 180 days) the provisions are limited to the provisions in OBC 



 

Business Regulation Impact Analysis 
OBC, OMC, OPC Rules 
Page 7 of 12 

Chapter 31 and OFC Chapter 24.  When the tent or membrane structure is intended for 
permanent use, the other provisions of the code apply.  
 
The State Fire Marshal submitted proposed amendments to be incorporated into 4101:1-
1-01 and 4101:1-27-01 as a result of a July 2, 2012 meeting, with the Department of 
Commerce and the State Fire Marshal to discuss coordination of the building and fire 
codes related to above-ground storage tanks.  During this meeting, it was discussed that 
fencing around these tanks and associated generators required by the Ohio Fire Code are 
sometimes not installed.  To address this problem, a reference to the Fire Code for 
temporary or permanent storage of flammable or combustible liquids has been added to 
4101:1-1-01 to inform owners that there may be additional requirements for these items.  
The proposed changes to 4101:1-27-01 are not included in this rule package. 
 
9. What scientific data was used to develop the rule or the measurable outcomes of 

the rule?  How does this data support the regulation being proposed? 
 

The substantive changes included in the proposed rules are based on changes 
incorporated into the National Fire Protection Association Life Safety Code as well 
changes to be incorporated into the future International Building Code published by the 
International Code Council and the American Society of Mechanical Engineers boiler 
standards.  These entities regularly update their publications through an American 
National Standards Institute (ANSI) approved voluntary consensus process to incorporate 
the most up-to-date scientific data and recognized new technologies.  Many of the 
proposed amendments are to recognize the newest editions of the technical standards 
these entities publish. 
 

Specifically, the proposed amendments to the Ohio Building and Mechanical 
Codes related to health care facilities in developed in coordination with the Ohio 
Department of Aging and Ohio Department of Health, Board Staff attended the 
International Council Council’s Spring 2012 code hearings in Dallas, Texas.  At these 
hearings, the ICC Code Technology Committee for Care Facilities presented proposed 
changes based on its recent work.  This committee reviews appropriate occupancies for 
care facilities (R-4, I-4, I-1, I-2); thresholds in terms of number of occupants for 
supervision; coordination with state laws; the necessary types of fire protection; and 
small group homes for both ambulatory and non-ambulatory care in residential 
environment.  It was this committee that developed and presented the language 
incorporated into the proposed rules for future adoption in the model building code.  The 
committee is made up of experts in risk management of health care facilities. 
 

Likewise, the proposed amendments related to accessibility were also developed 
by ICC Code Technology Committee on the International Building Code Coordination 
with the New ADAAG.  This committee is responsible for code changes needed to 
coordinate with the new ADAAG.  This committee is made up of state and federal 
experts in accessibility and the administration of the ADAAG requirements. 
 



 

Business Regulation Impact Analysis 
OBC, OMC, OPC Rules 
Page 8 of 12 

10. What alternative regulations (or specific provisions within the regulation) did the 
Agency consider, and why did it determine that these alternatives were not 
appropriate?  If none, why didn’t the Agency consider regulatory alternatives? 

 
Ohio Building Code Rules 
Many of the proposed amendments, while not substantively changing the rules, provide 
further clarity to the intent of the rules and improve ease of use of the code.  The major 
substantive changes are related to the effort to coordinate with the Departments of Aging 
and Health related to make changes that would enhance the quality of living for elders.  
As the Board was working with these departments, making code changes were not 
initially considered but rather that the Board would issue guidance documents to explain 
the application of the building code when a waiver is sought by a adult care facility 
owner from the Department of Health.  While the Board intends to still issue a guidance 
document, the decision was made to incorporate code changes as well to reduce conflicts 
between Department of Health’s licensure rules/policies and the building code. 
 
Ohio Mechanical Code Rules 
See above.  The other proposed change is intended to coordinate with referenced standard 
editions proposed to be adopted in the boiler and pressure vessel rules as a result of five 
year rule review and to be consistent with industry practice.  To not make these changes 
would result in lack of coordination between the codes. 
 
Ohio Plumbing Code Rules 
This proposed change is intended to coordinate with referenced standard editions within 
other Board rules.  To not make this change would result in lack of coordination between 
the codes. 
 
11. Did the Agency specifically consider a performance-based regulation?  Please 

explain. 
 

While many the proposed rules are non-substantive changes to the Ohio Building 
Code, continuing law permits a registered design professional’s alternative engineered 
design to be a compliance alternative method to the prescriptive requirements of the code.  
Section 106.5 of the code permits a registered design professional to submit sufficient 
technical data to substantiate that performance of the proposed alternative engineered 
design meets the intent of the code.  Additionally, section 107.4.3 provides that when 
construction documents have been prepared by an Ohio registered design professional 
conforming to the requirements of the rules of the Board pertaining to design loads, 
stresses, strength, and stability and other requirements involving technical analysis, the 
documents need only be examined to the extent necessary to determine conformity with 
other requirements of the rules of the Board. 

 
12. What measures did the Agency take to ensure that this regulation does not 

duplicate an existing regulation? 
 



 

Business Regulation Impact Analysis 
OBC, OMC, OPC Rules 
Page 9 of 12 

Editorial changes are routinely made to the rules to provide consistency with the 
Ohio Revised Code and other Board and agencies’ rules.  Additionally, many of the 
proposed amendments were developed in collaboration with other federal and state 
agencies.   
 

Significant changes to the Americans with Disabilities Act Accessibility 
Guidelines (ADAAG) were adopted by the US Department of Justice effective March 15, 
2011.  Since 1993 Ohio has adopted accessibility requirements to coordinate with 
ADAAG.  With the 2010 updates, Board Staff worked in conjunction with the 
International Code Council and representatives of the federal government to develop a 
group of revisions to the accessibility requirements included in the Ohio Building Code 
intended to streamline compliance.  The Board previously adopted these changes.  The 
additional revisions included in these proposed rules are intended to further this 
coordination.   
 

In April 2012, the Department of Aging coordinated a meeting between the State 
Fire Marshal, the Board, the Department of Commerce and the Department of Health to 
discuss upcoming waivers to the National Fire Protection Association’s (NFPA) Life 
Safety Code requirements for licensure of adult care facilities through the Department of 
Health and their impact on the building and fire codes.  As a result of this meeting, the 
Board developed amendments based on proposed changes discussed at the International 
Code Council’s (ICC) code hearings on the 2015 International Building Code conducted 
in Dallas, Texas in Spring 2012.  The discussions at the ICC hearings were spurred by 
efforts to coordinate the life safety code and international building code requirements to 
permit the development of a more home-like atmosphere in adult care facilities at a 
national level.  These proposed amendments to the Ohio Building Code advances these 
efforts in Ohio and will help to minimize conflicts between the life safety code and the 
building code and will safely enhance the quality of life for elders in Ohio.  These rules 
have been reviewed by the Ohio Department of Aging, Ohio Department of Health, and 
the State Fire Marshal. 
 

On July 2, 2012, the Board participated in a meeting with the Department of 
Commerce and the State Fire Marshal to discuss coordination of the building and fire 
codes related to above-ground storage tanks.  During this meeting, it was discussed that 
fencing around these tanks and associated generators required by the Ohio Fire Code are 
sometimes not installed.  To address this problem, a reference to the Fire Code for 
temporary or permanent storage of flammable or combustible liquids has been added to 
4101:1-1-01 to inform owners that there may be additional requirements for these items. 
 

With the transfer of regulatory authority for manufactured home parks from the 
Department of Health and the Public Health Council to the Ohio Manufactured Homes 
Commission (OMHC) included in HB 487, the proposed amendments include a reference 
to the rules of the rules of OMHC for manufactured home parks. 
 



 

Business Regulation Impact Analysis 
OBC, OMC, OPC Rules 
Page 10 of 12 

13. Please describe the Agency’s plan for implementation of the regulation including 
any measures that the regulation is applied consistently and predictably for the 
regulated community. 

 
For these rules to be enforced by a local government, its building department must 

be certified by the Board.  The Board also certifies the personnel who work within these 
departments to ensure only qualified personnel are enforcing the Board’s rules.  Certified 
personnel must complete continuing education to maintain their certifications and 
continue to be authorized to enforce these rules.  The Board has authority to suspend or 
revoke certifications for failure to properly enforce the rules.  Also, the Board has a staff 
member dedicated to responding to complaints by persons affected by the Board rules.  
This program helps promote consistent and predictable application of the Board rules. 
 
Adverse Impact to Business 
 
14. Provide a summary of the estimated cost of compliance with the rule.   

 
Specifically, please do the following: 

 a. Identify the scope of the impacted business community; 
 

The Board does not estimate an increased cost to the business community to 
comply with the substantive changes in the rules.  Other potential impacts include time 
spent to familiarize oneself with the substantive changes and the purchasing of the update 
pages for code books.   
 

b. Identify the nature of the adverse impact (e.g., license fees, fines, employer 
time for compliance); and 

 
See above. 

 
 c. Quantify the expected adverse impact from the regulation. 

The adverse impact can be quantified in terms of dollars, hours to comply, 
or other factors; and may be estimated for the entire regulated population 
or for a “representative business.”  Please include the source for your 
information/estimated impact. 

 
Cost to purchase update pages for a code book is approximately $32.   However, 

the Board does post adopted amendments to the Board’s rules on its website and provides 
free online access to eCodes via a link from the Board’s website: 
http://publicecodes.cyberregs.com/st/oh/st/OH-P-2011-000004.htm 
 
15. Why did the Agency determine that the regulatory intent justifies the adverse 

impact to the regulated business community? 
 

Many of the proposed amendments provide coordination with other agency 
requirements to help streamline compliance which may actually reduce costs.  



 

Business Regulation Impact Analysis 
OBC, OMC, OPC Rules 
Page 11 of 12 

Additionally, a significant portion of OAC 4101:1-1-01 related to building department 
and personnel certification requirements is being moved to another division of the 
administrative code.  Removing these provisions from the Ohio Building Code will 
decrease costs to the regulated community in the long run because they will not have to 
purchase updates to the building code for future amendments to certification 
requirements that would not affect a builder. 
 
Regulatory Flexibility 
 
16. Does the regulation provide any exemptions or alternative means of compliance 

for small business?  Please explain. 
 

The rules do not have special exemptions or alternative means of compliance 
specifically for small business.  The Ohio Building Code requires a building official to 
issue an adjudication order to an owner when the design or construction of a building 
does not comply with the Ohio Building Code.  The adjudication order must comply with 
Revised Code Chapter 119 and give the owner an opportunity to appeal.  This mechanism 
is often utilized by an owner voluntarily to obtain a variance from the requirements.  
Variance requests are heard by either the Ohio Board of Building Appeals or a certified 
local board of building appeals. 

Also, the Ohio Building Code permits alternative engineered designs prepared by 
a registered design professional to not strictly comply with the prescriptive requirements 
of the rules.  To obtain approvals based on alternative engineered designs, the design 
professional must submit sufficient technical information to demonstrate that the 
performance meets the intent of the rules. 
 
17. How will the agency apply Ohio Revised Code section 119.14 (waiver of fines and 

penalties for paperwork violations and first-time offenders) into implementation 
of the regulation? 

 
Revised Code § 3781.102 does not authorize the Board to set the fees and/or 

penalties assessed by local certified residential building departments in connection with 
the enforcement of these rules.  Compliance with the rules is accomplished through 
construction conforming to the certificate of plan approval (permit).  Therefore, there are 
no potential paperwork violations of these rules. 
 
18. What resources are available to assist small businesses with compliance of the 

regulation? 
 

The Board’s technical staff spends approximately 25% of their time responding to 
questions on the building codes and educating design professionals, contractors, the 
public, and code officials of the intent of the Board’s rules assisting all parties in 
compliance.  Also, it is the intent of the Board’s rules that they be liberally construed.  
Continuing law provides:  

The rules of the board and proceedings shall be liberally construed in order to 
promote its purpose. When the building official finds that the proposed design is a 



 

Business Regulation Impact Analysis 
OBC, OMC, OPC Rules 
Page 12 of 12 

reasonable interpretation of the provisions of this code, it shall be approved. 
Materials, equipment and devices approved by the building official pursuant to 
section 114 shall be constructed and installed in accordance with such approval. 


























































































	BIA for OBC, OMC, OPC
	OBC, OMC, OPC BIA Exhibit A Revised
	OBC, OMC, OPC BIA Exhibit B Revised
	OBC, OMC OPC BIA Exhibit C
	OBC, OMC OPC BIA Exhibit D

