
ACTION: Original DATE: 03/14/2017 2:23 PM

BIA p(170940) pa(312259) d: (671229) print date: 07/16/2025 2:04 PM



 

 

- 2 - 

1. Please briefly describe the draft regulation in plain language.   

Please include the key provisions of the regulation as well as any proposed amendments. 

The Ohio Board of Building Standards (Board) proposes to rescind all existing rules in 4101:1 

and adopt new Ohio Administrative Code (OAC) rules as follows:  

4101:1-1-01 This proposed rule regulates the administration of the building code by 

certified building departments and the steps an owner needs to take to obtain a plan 

approval or “permit” to build and inspections. 

4101:1-2-01 This proposed rule sets forth the definitions of terms used in rules 4101:1-1 

through 4101:1-35-01. 

4101:1-3-01 This proposed rule classifies buildings based on the purpose for which they are 

used. 

4101:1-4-01 This proposed rule supplements the code for special uses and occupancies and 

may alter requirements found elsewhere. 

4101:1-5-01 This proposed rule regulates the minimum type of construction of a building, 

including allowable height and area, mezzanines, unlimited area structures, and mixed 

occupancies. 

4101:1-6-01 This proposed rule classifies buildings in one of five (I-V) types of construction. 

4101:1-7-01 This proposed rule sets forth the requirements for fire-resistance-rated 

construction. 

4101:1-8-01 This proposed rule regulates the performance requirements for interior 

finishes to control the spread of fire. 

4101:1-9-01 This proposed rule sets forth the requirements for active fire safety provisions. 

4101:1-10-01 This proposed rule regulates the design of the means of egress of buildings for 

the protection of occupants. 

4101:1-11-01 This proposed rules regulates the accessibility of buildings for people with 

physical disabilities. 

4101:1-12-01 This proposed rule sets forth the requirements for the interior environment of 

buildings intended for human occupancy. 

4101:1-13-01 This proposed rule regulates the energy efficient of buildings by reference to 

the International Energy Conservation Code and ASHRAE 90.1 Standard. 

4101:1-14-01 This proposed rule provides requirements for the materials and construction 

of exterior surfaces. 

4101:1-15-01 This propose rule regulates the materials, design and construction of roofs. 

4101:1-16-01 This proposed rule prescribes the structural loading requirements for design 

and construction of buildings. 

4101:1-17-01 This proposed rule regulates special inspections structural observations and 

load testing. 



 

 

- 3 - 

4101:1-18-01 This proposed rule regulates the design and construction of building 

foundations. 

4101:1-19-01 This proposed rule sets for the provision for the design and construction of 

buildings and structural components using concrete. 

4101:1-20-01 This proposed rule regulates the use of aluminum in building construction. 

4101:1-21-01 This proposed rule prescribes requirements for masonry construction. 

4101:1-22-01 This proposed rule regulates design and construction of structural steel, cold-

formed steel, steel joists, steel cable structures, steel storage racks and composite 

construction. 

4101:1-23-01 This proposed rule sets forth the requirements for design and construction of 

buildings that include wood or wood-based structural components. 

4101:1-24-01 This proposed rule regulates the quality and design for glazing consisting of 

glass and light-transmitting plastics. 

4101:1-25-01 This proposed rule prescribes requirements for design, construction and 

quality of gypsum board and plaster. 

4101:1-26-01 This proposed rule sets forth the requirements for light transmitting and foam 

plastics. 

4101:1-27-01 This proposed rule regulates electrical installations and references the 

National Electrical Code. 

4101:1-28-01 This proposed rule regulates mechanical system installations and references 

the International Fuel Gas Code and Ohio Mechanical Code. 

4101:1-29-01 This proposed rule regulates plumbing system installations and references 

Ohio Plumbing Code. 

4101:1-30-01 This proposed rule regulates the installation of elevators and conveying 

systems not regulated by the Division of Industrial Compliance. 

4101:1-31-01 This proposed rule prescribes requirements for construction and protection of 

structures having unique characteristics, such as temporary and membrane structures. 

4101:1-32-01 This proposed rule regulates encroachments into the public right-of-way. 

4101:1-33-01 This proposed rule sets for requirements for safeguards during construction. 

4101:1-34-01 This proposed rule sets forth the requirements for alterations and additions of 

existing buildings and is based on 2012 International Building Code Chapter 34. 

4101:1-35-01 This proposed rule lists technical standards referenced in rules 4101:1-1 

through 4101:1-34. 

Significant changes to these rules are listed in attached Exhibit A. 

  



 

 

- 4 - 

2. Please list the Ohio statute authorizing the Agency to adopt this regulation. 

Revised Code § 3781.10: http://codes.ohio.gov/orc/3781.10 

Revised Code § 3781.11: http://codes.ohio.gov/orc/3781.11 

Revised Code § 3791.04: http://codes.ohio.gov/orc/3791.04v1 

 

3. Does the regulation implement a federal requirement?   Is the proposed regulation being 

adopted or amended to enable the state to obtain or maintain approval to administer and 

enforce a federal law or to participate in a federal program?  

If yes, please briefly explain the source and substance of the federal requirement. 

Yes. Proposed rule 4101:1-11-01 sets forth the accessibility requirements for buildings and 

compliance with these provisions creates a “safe harbor” for compliance with federal 

accessibility requirements.  The Department of Justice publishes regulations implementing 

the Americans with Disabilities Act (ADA) for title II (State and local government services) and 

title III (public accommodations and commercial facilities) and coordinates with the 2010 

Standards for Accessible Design ("2010 Standards”) referenced by the proposed rules.  The 

2010 Standards can be found here: http://www.ada.gov/2010ADAstandards_index.htm 

4. If the regulation includes provisions not specifically required by the federal government, 

please explain the rationale for exceeding the federal requirement. 

Not applicable. 

5. What is the public purpose for this regulation (i.e., why does the Agency feel that there 

needs to be any regulation in this area at all)? 

Revised Code § 3781.10 directs the Board to “formulate and adopt rules governing the 

erection, construction, repair, alteration and maintenance of all buildings specified in section 

3781.06 of the Revised Code…”  Additionally, Revised Code 3781.06 provides:  

Any building that may be used as a place of resort, assembly, education, entertainment, 

lodging, dwelling, trade, manufacture, repair, storage, traffic, or occupancy by the public, 

any residential building, and all other buildings or parts and appurtenances of those 

buildings erected within this state, shall be so constructed, erected, equipped, and 

maintained that they shall be safe and sanitary for their intended use and occupancy. 

This statute defines safe and sanitary as follows: 

“Safe,” with respect to a building, means it is free from danger or hazard to the life, safety, 

health, or welfare of persons occupying or frequenting it, or of the public and from danger 

http://codes.ohio.gov/orc/3781.10
http://codes.ohio.gov/orc/3781.11
http://codes.ohio.gov/orc/3791.04v1
http://www.ada.gov/2010ADAstandards_index.htm


 

 

- 5 - 

of settlement, movement, disintegration, or collapse, whether such danger arises from the 

methods or materials of its construction or from equipment installed therein, for the 

purpose of lighting, heating, the transmission or utilization of electric current, or from its 

location or otherwise. 

“Sanitary,” with respect to a building, means it is free from danger or hazard to the health 

of persons occupying or frequenting it or to that of the public, if such danger arises from 

the method or materials of its construction or from any equipment installed therein, for 

the purpose of lighting, heating, ventilating, or plumbing. 

The Ohio Building Code (OBC) sets forth the construction standards for nonresidential 

buildings in the State of Ohio to ensure that they are safe and sanitary.  Additionally, Revised 

Code § 3781.01 provides that local governments may not adopt regulations that that conflict 

with the Board’s rules to facilitate the uniform application of the standards.   

Revised Code 3781.11 lists conditions that rules of the Board must address, including: 

(1) For nonresidential buildings, provide uniform minimum standards and requirements, 

and for residential buildings, provide standards and requirements that are uniform 

throughout the state, for construction and construction materials, including construction 

of industrialized units, to make residential and nonresidential buildings safe and sanitary 

as defined in section 3781.06 of the Revised Code;  

(2) Formulate such standards and requirements, so far as may be practicable, in terms of 

performance objectives, so as to make adequate performance for the use intended the 

test of acceptability;  

(3) Permit, to the fullest extent feasible, the use of materials and technical methods, 

devices, and improvements, including the use of industrialized units which tend to reduce 

the cost of construction and erection without affecting minimum requirements for the 

health, safety, and security of the occupants or users of buildings or industrialized units 

and without preferential treatment of types or classes of materials or products or 

methods of construction;  

(4) Encourage, so far as may be practicable, the standardization of construction practices, 

methods, equipment, material, and techniques, including methods employed to produce 

industrialized units;  

 

http://codes.ohio.gov/orc/3781.06


 

 

- 6 - 

6. How will the Agency measure the success of this regulation in terms of outputs and/or 

outcomes? 

The enforcement of these rules will be implemented by certified township, city, and county 

building departments.  Rule 4101:1-1-01 lays out the administrative procedures certified 

building departments must follow to implement the substantive requirements of these rules 

to determine compliance.  These provisions require a builder or owner to make application 

to a building department to obtain an approval to build (permit).  As part of this application 

the owner must submit sufficient information and/or construction documents for the 

building official/plans examiner to determine whether the proposed work complies with the 

code.  After the builder or owner obtains the approval (permit), construction may commence 

and the building department inspectors will inspect the construction to ensure that the work 

conforms with the original approval.  Rule 4101:1-1-01 § 105.2 provides that in the absence 

of fraud or a serious safety or sanitation hazard, any non-residential structure built in 

accordance with approved plans shall be conclusively presumed to comply with these rules.  

The Board requires that certified nonresidential building departments submit an annual 

yearly operational report which lists the following information: current employees and their 

certifications, total number of permits issued during the year for each type of occupancy, 

total number of inspections made, the total value of construction, and the total number of 

appeals of the code requested by a builder or owner during the year. 

Development of the Regulation 

7. Please list the stakeholders included by the Agency in the development or initial review of 

the draft regulation.   

If applicable, please include the date and medium by which the stakeholders were initially 

contacted. 

The Board maintains a stakeholder distribution including building department personnel, 

contractors, designers and professional associations.  The stakeholder list is available upon 

request.  On October 7, 2016, the Board sent an email to all agency stakeholders informing 

them of a scheduled stakeholder meeting on October 28, 2016 to hear comments and 

respond to questions on these rules.  The notice summarized the proposed amendments and 

also informed stakeholders that if they could not attend the stakeholder meeting, they could 

submit questions or comments via email or regular mail by November 2, 2016.  On October 

28, 2016, the Board conducted a stakeholder meeting on the proposed rules at 10:00 AM and 

the following individuals attended: Mike Thompson, DIC, Emily Kaylor, CSI, Brian Damant, 

Central Ohio Chapter, NECA, Paul Buehrer, City of Oregon, Michelle Grago, DIC, Critty, 

Buenconsejo, Creative Housing, John Labriola, Summit County, Aaron Lichtenauer, DODD, 

Jacalyn Slemmer, Disability Housing Network, Tim Thompson, SFM, Tracie Boyd, SFM, Doug 



 

 

- 7 - 

Winder, US Green Building Council, Sarah Rice, Preview Group, Greg Bennett, Byers Minton 

– US GBC, and Chris Hess, Eaton.     

 

8. What input was provided by the stakeholders, and how did that input affect the draft 

regulation being proposed by the Agency? 

A copy of the correspondence the Board received in response to October 7, 2015 email and 

a summary of the October 28, 2016 stakeholder meeting are attached as Exhibit B.   The initial 

comments received were reviewed by the Board’s Code Committee at its November 3, 2016 

and December 8, 2016 meetings.  Additionally, the Board received Petition 16-16 submitted 

by the Ohio Electrical Coalition requesting updating the National Electrical Code (NEC) NFPA 

70 from the 2014 edition to the 2017 edition, Petition 16-10 submitted by the Ohio Building 

Officials Association (OBOA) to amend the certification requirements for plans examiners, 

and Petition 16-09 submitted by Pete Baldauf requesting changes to Section § 1008.1.10.  

Petitions 16-09, 16-10 and 16-16 are attached as Exhibit C. 

Numerous letters for support were submitted for adoption of the 2017 NEC.  Additionally, 

both Brian Damant, NECA, and Brian Hess, Eaton who attended the October 27, 2016 

stakeholder meeting indicated support for the adoption of the 2017 NEC.  At its November 3, 

2016 meeting, the Board’s code committee recommended approval of Petition 16-10.   

After working with the OBOA to develop alternative language the language proposed by 

Petition 16-10, approved modifications were included in proposed rule 4101:1-1-01 and an 

accompanying rule package amending the Board’s certification rules that would allow more 

avenues to qualify for plans examiner certifications. 

While the Board’s code committee recommended denial of Mr. Baldauf’s Petition 16-09, the 

committee worked with Mr. Baldauf to developed alternative language include in the rule 

package to address Mr. Balfauf’s concerns for coordination between proposed rules and the 

National Electrical Code. 

The remaining substantive comments were submitted by Critty Buenconsejo, Creative 

Housing, who attended the October 27, 2016 stakeholder meeting and submitted written 

comments requesting clarification to the proposed changes to rule 4101:1-3-01 for 

institutional occupancies as they would apply to group homes and written comments 

submitted by Pete Baldauf regarding plan review of fire protection systems by electrical plans 

examiners.  The Board’s code committee agreed with Mr. Baldaulf’s comment and removed 

the limitation for the plans examination of fire protection systems.  The Board’s code 

committee also responded to Ms. Buenconsejo revised rule 4101:1-3-01 attempting to 

provide further clarifications for institutional occupancies.  



 

 

- 8 - 

9. What scientific data was used to develop the rule or the measurable outcomes of the 

rule?  How does this data support the regulation being proposed? 

The proposed rules are based on the 2015 International Building Code (IBC) promulgated and 

amended by the International Code Council (ICC).  The model codes developed by ICC are 

updated every three years through a process that incorporates petitioning, public hearings 

and voting by ICC members.  The ICC Committees that oversaw the development of the 

different provisions 2015 IBC included building and fire code officials, architects, engineers, 

contractors, and representatives from the National Association of Home Builders, 

Underwriters Laboratories, and other professional organizations. 

When a petition to amend the model code is submitted, the proponent of the change must 

submit the proposed language of the amendment, the reason for the amendment including 

scientific data when applicable, and the cost impact of the amendment.  All submitted 

petitions are then published prior to initial code development hearings on the petitions.  

Interested persons may review the proposed changes and attend the code development 

hearing and provide comments.  A report then is published on the public hearings for review 

and then final action is taken on the proposed changes at final action hearings.  All successful 

changes are incorporated into the next edition of the model code.   

Upon publication the Board’s code committee reviews each substantive change included in 

the newest edition of the code and determines whether to recommend the change to the 

Board for adoption.  The Board last fully updated the OBC on November 1, 2011. 

10. What alternative regulations (or specific provisions within the regulation) did the Agency 

consider, and why did it determine that these alternatives were not appropriate?  If none, 

why didn’t the Agency consider regulatory alternatives? 

See Question 9.   

11. Did the Agency specifically consider a performance-based regulation? Please explain. 

Performance-based regulations define the required outcome, but don’t dictate the process 

the regulated stakeholders must use to achieve compliance. 

The rules permit a registered design professional’s alternative engineered design to be a 

compliance alternative method to the prescriptive requirements of the code.  Section 106.5 

of the OBC permits a registered design professional to submit sufficient technical data to 

substantiate that performance of the proposed alternative engineered design meets the 

intent of the code.  Additionally, section 107.4.3 provides that when construction documents 

have been prepared by an Ohio registered design professional conforming to the 

requirements of the rules of the Board pertaining to design loads, stresses, strength, and 

stability and other requirements involving technical analysis, the documents need only be 



 

 

- 9 - 

examined to the extent necessary to determine conformity with other requirements of the 

rules of the Board. 

12. What measures did the Agency take to ensure that this regulation does not duplicate an 

existing Ohio regulation? 

Editorial changes are routinely made to the rules to provide consistency with the Ohio 

Revised Code and other Board and agencies’ rules.  Additionally, RC §  3781.10 gives the Board 

sole authority to adopt rules which regulate the erection, construction, repair, alteration, and 

maintenance of all buildings or classes of buildings specified RC 3781.06 including residential 

and non-residential buildings.  

13. Please describe the Agency’s plan for implementation of the regulation, including any 

measures to ensure that the regulation is applied consistently and predictably for the 

regulated community. 

For these rules to be enforced by a local government, its building department must be 

certified by the Board.  The Board also certifies the personnel who work within these 

departments to ensure only qualified personnel are enforcing the Board’s rules.  Certified 

personnel must complete continuing education to maintain their certifications and continue 

to be authorized to enforce these rules.  The Board has authority to suspend or revoke 

certifications for failure to properly enforce the rules.  Also, the Board has a staff member 

dedicated to responding to complaints by persons affected by the Board rules.  This program 

helps promote consistent and predictable application of the Board rules. 

Adverse Impact to Business 

14. Provide a summary of the estimated cost of compliance with the rule.  Specifically, please 

do the following: 

a. Identify the scope of the impacted business community;  

• Building owners 

• Design Professionals 

• Contractors 

• Building Department Personnel 

 

b. Identify the nature of the adverse impact (e.g., license fees, fines, employer time 

for compliance); and  

• Obtaining updated rules as published as the Ohio Building Code 

• Becoming familiar with the changes through research and training 

http://codes.ohio.gov/orc/3781.06


 

 

- 10 - 

• Increased cost of construction due to changes that require different 

construction methods/materials/products or increased stringency of 

construction standards. 

 

c. Quantify the expected adverse impact from the regulation.  

The adverse impact can be quantified in terms of dollars, hours to comply, or other 

factors; and may be estimated for the entire regulated population or for a 

“representative business.” Please include the source for your 

information/estimated impact. 

Due to the variance in allowed building designs, it is difficult to ascertain, in dollars, a 

cost increase/decrease in the design cost of a building as a result of the proposed code 

update.  However, as discussed in Question 9 above, when a code change proponent 

submits a petition to ICC to amend the model code an estimated cost impact of the 

proposal is included.  Of the significant changes, the following sections included in the 

proposed rules were noted by the proponent as having a cost increase in construction: 

Section 90.7 - Carbon monoxide alarms – Group I & R with fuel fired appliances 

Section 909.21.1 – Elevator hoistway pressurization measurements 

Section 915 - Carbon monoxide detection in Group I, R & E classrooms 

Section 1029.1.1.1 – Separation of spaces under grandstands and bleachers 

Section 1203.1 – Mechanical ventilation required in dwelling units <5ACH50 

Sections 1404.12 & 1405.18 – Polypropylene siding materials fire spread & fire 

separation distance 

Section 1507.16 – Fire resistance of roof supporting roof gardens and landscaped 

roofs 

Section 1705.16 – Special inspection of fire-resistant penetration & joint systems 

mandatory for high-rise buildings and Risk Category III or IV 

Section 3008 – Occupant evacuation elevator requirements coordinated with 

provisions for fire service access elevators 

Additionally, as a result of approved Petition 16-16 updating the NEC reference to the 

2017 edition will have impact on cost of construction to comply with new electrical 

requirements. 

The new Ohio Building Code publication will be available from publishers at an 

approximate cost of $150.   

15. Why did the Agency determine that the regulatory intent justifies the adverse impact to 

the regulated business community? 



 

 

- 11 - 

The majority of the provisions noted above as having an increased cost impact enhance life 

safety provisions of the code.  Additionally, other changes included in the rule package will 

decrease cost of construction, offer regulatory alternatives, and recognize new technologies 

and materials.  For instance, as described in Petition 16-06 in Exhibit C, the 2017 NEC may 

provide relief on the overall cost of the electrical system: 

• New exception for bank and office occupancies permitting reduction of lighting load 

based on allowable load density prescribed by adopted energy codes. This may grant 

substantial relief for sizing of service and feeder distribution systems. 

• Deletion of Table 310.15(B)(3)(c). This removes the required temperature adder for 

ambient temperature adjustment correction when calculating conductor size for 

conductors installed on rooftops exposed to sunlight unless conductors are installed 

7/8” or closer to the roof. 

• Expansion of use of 83% reduction for 3-conductor (2 hots and a neutral) feeders 

derived from either single or three phase supplies. 

• Revised to only require cables with 10 AWG and smaller conductors to default to the 

60 degree C ampacity where installed in insulation. 

• New language covering any of the GFCI requirements involving a measurement to 

determine receptacle proximity. 

• Revision to permit any appliance installed in rooms or areas required to be supplied 

by a 20 ampere small appliance branch circuit to be supplied from an individual branch 

circuit rated 15 amperes or greater. 

• Revisions to only require a receptacle for service equipment located indoors and new 

exception for services rated more than 120 volts to ground that supply certain types 

of equipment. 

Finally, until the current edition the Board updated the codes every three years.  The Board 

has taken steps to lengthen the time between code updates to reduce the impact on the 

construction community.  To date, however, 14 states have already adopted the 2015 IBC 

and another 19 have adopted the 2012 IBC.  Projects are designed months and years in 

advance.  Design professionals need predictability to be able to design the appropriate 

standards.  This update will keep Ohio’s code aligned with the majority of other states. 

 

Regulatory Flexibility 

16. Does the regulation provide any exemptions or alternative means of compliance for small 

businesses?  Please explain. 

The rules do not have special exemptions or alternative means of compliance specifically for 

small business.  The OBC requires a building official to issue an adjudication order to an owner 

when the design or construction of a building does not comply with the OBC.  The 

adjudication order must comply with Revised Code Chapter 119 and give the owner an 

opportunity to appeal.  This mechanism is often utilized by an owner voluntarily to obtain a 



 

 

- 12 - 

variance from the requirements.  Variance requests are heard by either the Ohio Board of 

Building Appeals or a certified local board of building appeals. 

Also, the OBC permits alternative engineered designs prepared by a registered design 

professional to not strictly comply with the prescriptive requirements of the rules.  To obtain 

approvals based on alternative engineered designs, the design professional must submit 

sufficient technical information to demonstrate that the performance meets the intent of the 

rules. 

17. How will the agency apply Ohio Revised Code section 119.14 (waiver of fines and 

penalties for paperwork violations and first-time offenders) into implementation of the 

regulation? 

Revised Code § 3781.102 does not authorize the Board to set the fees and/or penalties 

assessed by local certified building departments in connection with the enforcement of these 

rules.  Compliance with the rules is accomplished through construction conforming to the 

certificate of plan approval (permit).  Therefore, there are no potential paperwork violations 

of these rules. 

18. What resources are available to assist small businesses with compliance of the 

regulation? 

As these proposed rules updates the Ohio Building Code to a new model code edition, the 

Board offers training and resources to building department personnel to prepare them to 

enforce the new codes.  These resources are paid for by assessment fees collected by certified 

building departments pursuant to RC 3781.102 on behalf of the Board to be used exclusively 

for (1) the operating costs of the Board, (2) providing services, including educational 

programs, for building departments certified by the Board, and (3) paying the expenses of the 

Residential Construction Advisory Committee. 

Additionally, the Board’s technical staff spends approximately 25% of their time responding 

to questions on the building codes and educating design professionals, contractors, the 

public, and code officials of the intent of the Board’s rules assisting all parties in compliance.   


















































































































































































	Business Impact Analysis_2017 OBC (Autosaved)
	Exhibits

